
My Truth Will Be Found In The 3 Days of Darkness 4-10-25 @ 12:53 PM 
 
“I’m here, Jesus Christ my Love. I heard You call out to me, “Come.” “Daughter, I would speak 
with you.” “I am here. I’m available. I’m listening, my Lovely Jesus Christ.” “Truth. My truth, I 
give to thee to speak this day. A great sifting has been occurring among My children as each time 
mercy was granted. In this sifting, was found who had their roots truly grounded in Me. Those 
who seek Me shall find Me. Those who earnestly seek the truth shall find it, for I AM Truth. I 
AM Righteousness. I AM Love. I AM Fairness in all things, showing no favor or respect from 
one child of Mine to another. In this great sifting, many have turned from My warnings, because 
these things did not occur as first spoken. These are those who don’t understand My great love 
for mankind or My mercy. These are those who say they try and test everything, but they do not. 
They lie. For I see all things. Yet, still many of these are My children that love Me. It’s inside the 
3 Days of Darkness they will know both My truth and My mercy, granted to all who repent. I will 
forgive their sins of lying, rebellion, and stubbornness, and wash them clean in My precious 
blood as the true season of Purim ends.”  
 
“Inside the gross darkness, with only candlelight for most of My children, repentance can be 
found. Amidst the screams of the enemy, the demons, nephilim, and fallen ones making their 
entrance into the world by various means, except for the technology of the Portal Particle 
Accelerators and other such like devices they will be aware, but not tormented by the darkness. 
The Outer Darkness, which both is alive and evil. There will be a Great Harvest of souls inside 
the 3 Days of Darkness. Yet even in this, it’s smaller than most realize. This is because narrow is 
the way that leads to righteousness and My Heaven, and few there will be that find it. While wide 
is the path so many choose that leads their soul to eternal darkness. The changing of the Moon is 
to occur again. This time making it more than a quarter, but you are still in the quarter stage until 
the Full Moon peaks on the 12th of your calendar, Daughter, of this month. But, Daughter, I 
showed you it’s only a Quarter you’re looking for, not a Full Moon, in a prior dream.” 
 
“Your world will never be the same again. Once the darkness lifts, those left behind in your world 
will be faced with a world they no longer recognize. Although once the 3 Days of Darkness is 
finally lifted with many who died, due to the horrors they endured, and others including the 
innocent children and like-minded, not of the nephilim, missing…they vanished without a trace, 
the demons, nephilim, and fallen ones will not all show themself fully or publicly at first until the 
Antichrist’s position is secured. This means most of these occurrences outside of these 3 Days of 
Darkness, while occurring at times, will be kept hidden and stifled for the majority of the 
remaining inhabitants of the earth.” 
 
“I have called you here, Daughter, asking you once again to step out in faith in My Name, Jesus 
Christ, Yeshua Ha’ Mashiach, your Lord and Savior. Sound the warning cry: It’s here. It has 
arrived, and is in its final position to descend. Remember, Daughter, the 10 hidden suitcases in 
your nation, now called Babylon to Me, will detonate swiftly like dominoes. They will be 
followed quickly by the appearance of the Aurora dancing lights. The 48 hours, again, I remind 
My children, is divided and broken into the 12 predominant World Time Zones. So you do not 
have a full 2 days, but hours for some and less for others. Then the darkness for 3 days shall 
surely descend like in the appearance of someone turning off the lights of your world, because 
this is exactly what I am doing. This shall be suddenly. It shall be swift upon this world.” 



“Daughter, I have been moved in My heart, My bowels of compassion, for those crying out for 
more time to reach the lost. I’ve been moved by love and mercy for those pleading to be spared 
the foretold nuclear attack upon the land of Ukraine and the darkness of 3 days by My children in 
the area and nearby. I have been moved, Daughter, moved by mercy. And now I’m listening to 
the cries of My children crying out in longing, those crying out in anguish, those wrongfully 
imprisoned, martyred, and so much more. Now I’m moved in love and mercy for My Ready 
Bride. Those who have chosen to adorn themselves in their bridal attire, keeping themself pure 
and unspotted from the world. And now I say to them once again: Mercy has been granted on 
your behalf, My Bride. It’s time to come Home, My Bride. It's time for you to come Home.” 
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